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Larkin Conner Barkley lives like the City of Angels is hers for the taking. Young and staggeringly rich, she
speeds through the city during its loneliest hours, blowing through red after red in her Aston Martin as if
running for her life. Until out of nowhere a car appears, and with it the metal-on-metal explosion of a terrible
accident. Dazed, Larkin attempts to help the other victims. And finds herself the sole witness in a secret
federal investigation. For maybe the first time in her life, Larkin wants to do the right thing. But by agreeing
to cooperate with the authorities, she becomes the target for a relentless team of killers. And when the U.S.
Marshals and the finest security money can buy can't protect her, Larkin's wealthy family turns to the one
man money can't buy - Joe Pike. Pike lives a world away from the palaces of Beverly Hills. He's an ex-cop,
ex-Marine, ex-mercenary who owes a bad man a favor, and that favor is to keep Larkin alive. The one upside
of the job is reuniting with Bud Flynn, Pike's LAPD training officer, and a man Pike reveres as a father. The
downside is Larkin Barkley, who is the uncontrollable cover girl for self-destruction - and as deeply alone as
Pike. Pike commits himself to protecting the girl, but when they immediately come under fire, he realizes
someone is selling them out. In defiance of Bud and the authorities, Pike drops off the grid with the girl and
follows his own rules of survival: strike fast, hit hard, hunt down the hunters. With the help of private
investigator Elvis Cole, Pike uncovers a web of lies and betrayals, and the stunning revelation that even the
cops are not who they seem. As the body count rises, Pike's biggest threat might come from the girl herself, a
lost soul in the City of Angels, determined to destroy herself unless Joe Pike can teach her the value of
life...and love.
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From reader reviews:

Colby Tapia:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or data even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know which one you should start with. This The Watchman (A Joe Pike Novel)
[Abridged][Audiobook] (Audio CD) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why,
since this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Victor Parisi:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write about the
information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this
The Watchman (A Joe Pike Novel) [Abridged][Audiobook] (Audio CD).

Alice Billups:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
due to the fact book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The The
Watchman (A Joe Pike Novel) [Abridged][Audiobook] (Audio CD) provide you with a new experience in
studying a book.

Karen Ofarrell:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this The Watchman (A Joe Pike Novel) [Abridged][Audiobook] (Audio CD) can make you really feel
more interested to read.
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