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In a small, locally owned Trinidadian factory that produces household goods, 80 percent of the line workers
are women, almost all black or East Indian. The supervisors are all men, either white or East Indian. Kevin
Yelvington worked for a year in this factory to study how ethnicity and gender are integral elements of the
class structure, a social and economic structure that permeates all relations between men and women in the
factory. These primary divisions determine the way the production process is ordered and labor divided.
Unlike women in other industries in "underdeveloped" parts of the world who are recruited by foreign firms,
Caribbean women have always contributed to the local economy. Within this historical context, Yelvington
outlines the development of the state, and addresses exploitation and domination in the labor process.
Yelvington also documents the sexually charged interactions between workers and managers and explores
how both use flirting and innuendo to their advantage. Weddings and other social events outside the factory
provide insightful details about how the creation of social identities carries over to all aspects of the local
culture. Author note: Kevin A. Yelvington teaches anthropology at the University of South Florida and is
editor of Trinidad Ethnicity.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Williams:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book Producing Power: Ethnicity,
Gender, and Class in a Caribbean Workplace. All type of book could you see on many solutions. You can
look for the internet options or other social media.

Terri Root:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or details even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming
to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This Producing Power: Ethnicity, Gender, and
Class in a Caribbean Workplace is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and need in this era.

John Stewart:

Do you among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Producing Power: Ethnicity, Gender, and Class in a Caribbean
Workplace book is readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the information
here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to
provide to you. The writer of Producing Power: Ethnicity, Gender, and Class in a Caribbean Workplace
content conveys objective easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different
in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Producing Power:
Ethnicity, Gender, and Class in a Caribbean Workplace is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Ronald Marinelli:

Reading a book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write
about the ability about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try
to improve their proficiency in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book.
One of them is this Producing Power: Ethnicity, Gender, and Class in a Caribbean Workplace.
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