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Frida Kahlo was born in 1907 to parents of German and Spanish descent, in Coyoacan, outside Mexico City.
After contracting polio at age six, Frida also suffered severe injuries in a bus accident. Her time spent in
recovery turned her toward a painting career. These experiences, combined with a difficult marriage to the
artist Diego Rivera, generated vibrant works depicting Frida's experiences with pain as well as the
symbolism and spirit of Mexican culture. Though she died in 1954, interest in her work continues to grow,
with museum exhibitions and publications around the world. This biography will introduce art students and
adult readers to one of the Latino culture's most beloved artists.

In 2002, the film Frida introduced the artist and her works to a new audience. In 2007, the 100th anniversary
of Kahlo's birth, a major exhibition of her work was held at the Museum of the Fine Arts Palace in Mexico.
In 2007 through 2008, another major exhibition began its journey to museums throughout the United States.
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From reader reviews:

Irving Gaston:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can know everything you want by a guide. Book has
a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the world. Alongside that
you can your reading talent was fluently. A e-book Frida Kahlo: A Biography (Greenwood Biographies) will
make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some
of you think this open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might
be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or acceptable book with you?

Brett Baker:

Do you among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Frida Kahlo: A Biography (Greenwood Biographies) book is readable by you who
hate those perfect word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading through
experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
connected with Frida Kahlo: A Biography (Greenwood Biographies) content conveys the idea easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just
different in the form of it. So , do you even now thinking Frida Kahlo: A Biography (Greenwood
Biographies) is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Chrissy Stallings:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to can
satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time
to be learn. Frida Kahlo: A Biography (Greenwood Biographies) can be your answer because it can be read
by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Ralph Rodriguez:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Frida Kahlo: A
Biography (Greenwood Biographies) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
observe.
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