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A dynamic leader shares how a commitment to core principles brings success in life and in leadership roles.

Written by Dawn McCoy, one of the youngest elected members to serve on the Sacramento City Unified
School Board of Trustees, this pivotal book shows how ordinary people can become extraordinary leaders.
Geared towards aspiring leaders or those already in leadership positions, Leadership Building Blocks: An
Insider's Guide to Success outlines seven strategies to achieve success. These include Vision, Balance,
Courage, Relationship Building, Tenacity (crisis management and communication skills), and Commitment
to Legacy.

In this book, McCoy candidly shares personal triumphs and challenges she faced in the political arena and
other leadership roles. She draws attention to Leadership Building Blocks fundamentals, skills designed to
distinguish a leader.

Each concept is illustrated by an example, application, and story. With easy-to-follow icons, leadership self-
assessments, and goal-setting worksheets, McCoy takes readers through her experiences while
simultaneously giving them tools to succeed in their leadership roles.  McCoy asks questions like: How do
you get started as a leader? How will you cope when thrust into sudden leadership limelight or crisis? How
do leaders manage competing priorities? Leadership Building Blocks answers these questions and dozens
more with step-by-step procedures about where leaders begin, how they can advocate for their cause, and
how they can deftly maneuver through unpredictable circumstances.

As she recounts her leadership journey, McCoy proves she is well qualified to answer these questions given
her roles as a political advisor, community activist, nonprofit executive, leadership consultant, and author.
She shares how the Leadership Building Blocks concepts have served as a template for success throughout
her career.Leadership Building Blocks: An Insider's Guide to Success provides just that in solid, easy-to-
digest, and satisfying pieces.
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From reader reviews:

Debra Yarbrough:

With other case, little folks like to read book Leadership Building Blocks: An Insider's Guide to Success.
You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Given that we know about how is important
any book Leadership Building Blocks: An Insider's Guide to Success. You can add expertise and of course
you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple point until
wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by
internet system. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's study.

Rosemary Perez:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above.
Every person has several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or
something that they don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book
Leadership Building Blocks: An Insider's Guide to Success. All type of book is it possible to see on many
solutions. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Sunny Weaver:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its include may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look likes.
Maybe you answer may be Leadership Building Blocks: An Insider's Guide to Success why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you
to pick up this book.

Harold Fleming:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or real their
pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Leadership Building Blocks: An Insider's Guide to Success can make you
experience more interested to read.
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