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Drawing upon a wealth of journal writings and personal correspondence, Esther Leslie presents a uniquely
intimate portrait of one of the intellectual giants of the twentieth century, Walter Benjamin. She sets his life
in the context of his middle-class upbringing; explores the social, political, and economic upheaval in
Germany during and after World War I; and recounts Benjamin’s eccentric love of toys, trick-books, travel,
and ships. From the Frankfurt School and his influential friendships with Theodore Adorno, Gershom
Scholem, and Bertolt Brecht, to his travels across Europe, Walter Benjamin traces out the roots of
Benjamin’s groundbreaking writings and their far-reaching impact in his own time. Leslie argues that
Benjamin’s life challenges the stereotypical narrative of the tragic and lonely intellectual figure—instead
positioning him as a man who relished the fierce combat of competing theories and ideas.

Closing with his death at the Spanish-French border in a desperate flight from the Nazis and Stalin, Walter
Benjamin is a concise and concentrated account of a capacious intellect trapped by hostile circumstances.
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From reader reviews:

Tammi Kendrick:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How
individuals to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book.
Reading a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Walter Benjamin
(Reaktion Books - Critical Lives) book because book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the
details in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Patrick Vanmeter:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic inside
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill
your own free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to try
look for book, may be the book untitled Walter Benjamin (Reaktion Books - Critical Lives) can be good
book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Kristopher Sutherland:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Walter Benjamin (Reaktion Books -
Critical Lives) can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending
your time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the
others?

Teresa Sullivan:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen require book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we
know those textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to
around the world. Through the book Walter Benjamin (Reaktion Books - Critical Lives) we can acquire more
advantage. Don't you to be creative people? For being creative person must want to read a book. Merely
choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this book
Walter Benjamin (Reaktion Books - Critical Lives). You can more inviting than now.
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