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A Manhattan or a Sazerac; neat, on the rocks, or with a splash of soda—no matter how it’s served up,
whiskey is synonymous with the poet’s inspiration and the devil’s spirit. Be it bourbon, rye, corn, Irish, or
Scotch, whiskey has an infamous and celebrated history from a sometimes lethal, herb-infused concoction to
a high-quality, meticulously crafted liquor.

            In Whiskey, Kevin R. Kosar delivers an informative, concise narrative of the drink’s history, from its
obscure medieval origins to the globally traded product that it is today. Focusing on three nations—Scotland,
Ireland, and America—Kosar charts how the technique of distillation moved from ancient Egypt to the
British Isles. Contrary to popular claims, there were no good old days of whiskey: before the twentieth
century, consumers could never be sure just what was being poured in their cup—unscrupulous profiteers
could distill anything into booze and pawn it off as whiskey. Eventually, government and industry
established legal definitions of what whiskey is and how it could be made, allowing for the distinctive styles
of whiskey known today.

Whiskey explains what whiskey is, how it is made, and how the types of whiskey differ. With a list of
suggested brands and classic cocktail recipes for the thirsty reader, this book is perfect for drink and food
enthusiasts and history lovers alike.
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From reader reviews:

Hazel Park:

Here thing why this particular Whiskey: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible) are different and
trusted to be yours. First of all studying a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of computer
which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Whiskey: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible)
giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no book that
similar with Whiskey: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible). It gives you thrill reading through
journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is perhaps can
be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your method home by
train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Whiskey: A Global
History (Reaktion Books - Edible) in e-book can be your choice.

Jessica Henriquez:

The publication untitled Whiskey: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible) is the guide that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you.
The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot
of research when write the book, therefore the information that they share to your account is absolutely
accurate. You also could get the e-book of Whiskey: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible) from the
publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Diana Gum:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read a book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent
all day long to reading a e-book. The book Whiskey: A Global History (Reaktion Books - Edible) it is
extremely good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying
reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You
can m0ore simply to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book
provides high quality.

Joyce Francois:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of news. With
this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
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