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Knowledge management goes beyond data and information capture in computerized health records and
ordering systems; it seeks to leverage the experiences of all who interact in healthcare to enhance care
delivery, teamwork, and organizational learning. Knowledge management - if envisioned thoughtfully - takes
a systemic approach to implementation that includes the embodiment of a learning culture. Knowledge is
then used to support that culture and the knowledge workers within it to encourage them to share what they
know, thusly enabling their peers, their organizations and ultimately their patients to benefit from their
experience to proactively dismantle hierarchy and encourage sharing about what works, and what doesnâ€™t
to focus efforts on improvement. Knowledge Management in Healthcare draws on relevant business, clinical
and health administration literature plus the analysis of discussions with a variety of clinical, administrative,
leadership, patient and information experts. The result is a book that will inform thinking on knowledge
access needs to mitigate potential failures, design lasting improvements and support the sharing of what is
known to enable work towards attaining high reliability. It can be used as a general tool for leaders and
individuals wishing to devise and implement a knowledge-sharing culture in their institution, design
innovative activities supporting transparency and communication to strengthen existing programs intended to
enhance knowledge sharing behaviours and contribute to high quality, safe care.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Gay:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who don't
like studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Knowledge Management in Healthcare.

Mildred Patton:

With other case, little folks like to read book Knowledge Management in Healthcare. You can choose the
best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is important the book Knowledge
Management in Healthcare. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign
or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we
can easily open a book or even searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You need to use it when
you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's examine.

Bruce Bracey:

This book untitled Knowledge Management in Healthcare to be one of several books that will best seller in
this year, here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy
this particular book in the book retailer or you can order it via online. The publisher in this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone.
So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Daniel Rhoads:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Knowledge Management in Healthcare was
colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Knowledge Management in
Healthcare has many kinds or type. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation
company Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are
generally make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book to
suit your needs and try to like reading which.
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