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Smart materials--materials and structures that can impart information about their environment to an observer
or monitoring device--are revolutionizing fields as diverse as engineering, optics, and medical technology.
Advances in smart materials are impacting disciplines across the scientific and technological landscape.

Now, practictioners and researchers have an authoritative source to go to for answers about this emerging
new area. Encyclopedia of Smart Materials provides A-to-Z coverage of the entire field of intelligent
materials. Discussions of theory, fabrication, processing, applications, and uses of these unique materials are
presented here in a collection of concise entries from the world's foremost experts in the field--including
scientists, educators and engineers.

This encyclopedia is as broad in scope as the technology itself, addressing daily, commercial applications as
well as sophisticated units designed to operate in space, underwater, underground, and within the human
body. Extensively cross-referenced and generously supplemented with bibliographies and indexes, this
book's treatment also broaches the specialized properties and coatings that are required for the use of
materials in extreme conditions.

Illustrated with photographs, tables, line drawings, and equations, Encyclopedia of Smart Materials is the
premier reference for material scientists, chemists, chemical engineers, process engineers, consultants, patent
attorneys and students in these areas. An essential resource on the shelves of laboratories, government
facilities, and academic libraries.

Editor-in-Chief, Mel Schwartz has over forty years of experience with metals, ceramics, and composites,
with special expertise in brazing. The holder of five patents, he has authored thirteen books and more than
one hundred technical papers and articles.

Reach the information you need rapidly and easily with the ONLINE edition of the Encyclopedia of Smart
Materials. The online edition delivers all the rich content of the print edition with the added benefits of an
advanced search engine and the desktop convenience of web access. For more information or to license the
online edition (beginning July 2002) please visit: www.interscience.wiley.com/reference/esm
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From reader reviews:

Diana Sturgill:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try and and must have the free time or they will get lots
of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try
this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book
you have read is usually Encyclopedia of Smart Materials, 2 Volume Set.

Jordan Sena:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its cover may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside appear
likes. Maybe you answer may be Encyclopedia of Smart Materials, 2 Volume Set why because the amazing
cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will
be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this
book.

Candice Foushee:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Encyclopedia of Smart
Materials, 2 Volume Set which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Robert Bowser:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you could
have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific Encyclopedia of Smart Materials, 2
Volume Set can give you a lot of friends because by you investigating this one book you have issue that they
don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get
success. This e-book offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than
additional make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have Encyclopedia of Smart
Materials, 2 Volume Set.
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