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This study investigates the controversial motion pictures written and directed by the independent filmmaker
Kim Ki-duk, one of the most acclaimed Korean auteurs in the English-speaking world. Propelled by
underdog protagonists who can only communicate through shared corporeal pain and extreme violence,
Kim's graphic films have been classified by Western audiences as belonging to sensationalist East Asian
"extreme" cinema, and Kim has been labeled a "psychopath" and "misogynist" in South Korea.
 
Drawing upon both Korean-language and English-language sources, Hye Seung Chung challenges these
misunderstandings, recuperating Kim's oeuvre as a therapeutic, yet brutal cinema of Nietzschean
ressentiment (political anger and resentment deriving from subordination and oppression). Chung argues that
the power of Kim's cinema lies precisely in its ability to capture, channel, and convey the raw emotions of
protagonists who live on the bottom rungs of Korean society. She provides historical and postcolonial
readings of victimization and violence in Kim's cinema, which tackles such socially relevant topics as
national division in Wild Animals and The Coast Guard and U.S. military occupation in Address Unknown.
She also explores the religious and spiritual themes in Kim's most recent works, which suggest possibilities
of reconciliation and transcendence.
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From reader reviews:

Tatum Martin:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Kim Ki-duk (Contemporary Film Directors). Try to
make book Kim Ki-duk (Contemporary Film Directors) as your friend. It means that it can for being your
friend when you really feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is
very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know almost
everything by the book. So , let me make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Denise Niemi:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Kim Ki-duk (Contemporary Film
Directors). All type of book can you see on many methods. You can look for the internet resources or other
social media.

Lily Terry:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
any time those information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Kim Ki-duk (Contemporary Film Directors) as your
daily resource information.

Brooke Fisher:

The guide with title Kim Ki-duk (Contemporary Film Directors) includes a lot of information that you can
find out it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new know-how the information that
exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to
understand how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.
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