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 The Molecular Biology of Cancer, Stella Pelengaris & Michael Khan

 This capturing, comprehensive text, extensively revised and updated for its second edition, provides a
detailed overview of the molecular mechanisms underpinning the development of cancer and its treatment.

 “Bench to Bedside”: A key strength of this book that sets it apart from general cancer biology references is
the interweaving of all aspects of cancer biology from the causes, development and diagnosis through to the
treatment and care of cancer patients – essential for providing a broader view of cancer and its impact.

 The highly readable presentation of a complex field, written by an international panel of researchers,
specialists and practitioners, would provide an excellent text for graduate and undergraduate courses in the
biology of cancer, medical students and qualified practitioners in the field preparing for higher exams, and
for researchers and teachers in the field.

 For the teaching of cancer biology, special features have been included to facilitate this use: bullet points at
the beginning of each chapter explaining key concepts and controversial areas; each chapter builds on
concepts learned in previous chapters, with a list of key outstanding questions remaining in the field,
suggestions for further reading, and questions for student review. All chapters contain text boxes that provide
additional and relevant information.

 Key highlights are listed below: 

An overview of the cancer cell and important new concepts. ●

Selected human cancers: lung, breast, colorectal, prostate, renal, skin, cervix, and hematological●

malignancies. 

Key cellular processes in cancer biology including  (a) traditionally important areas such as cell cycle●

control, growth regulation, oncogenes and tumour suppressors apoptosis, as well as (b) more highly topical
areas of apoptosis, telomeres, DNA damage and repair, cell adhesion, angiogenesis, immunity, epigenetics,
and the proteasome. 

Clinical oncology: In-depth coverage of important concepts such as screening, risk of cancer and●

prevention, diagnoses, managing cancer patients from start to palliative care and end-of-life pathways.

Chapters highlighting the direct links between cancer research and clinical applications. ●

 New coverage on how cancer drugs are actually used in specific cancer patients, and how therapies are●

developed and tested. 

Systems Biology and cutting edge research areas covered such as RNA interference (RNAi). ●

Each chapter includes key points, chapter summaries, text boxes, and topical references for added●

comprehension and review. 



Quotations have been used in each chapter to introduce basic concepts in an entertaining way.●

Supported by a dedicated website at www.blackwellpublishing.com/pelengaris ●

 We should list the great reviews we got for first edition which are on the back of the 2nd edition:

“A capturing, comprehensive, clearly written and absolutely accurate introduction into cancer
biology…..This book deserves great praise for the readable presentation of this complex field….the true
synthesis of bench and bedside approaches is marvelously achieved.” Christian Schmidt, Molecular Cell

“Chapters address the issues of cancer diagnosis, treatment, and patient care and set the book apart from
general molecular biology references….This book is applicable to both graduate and undergraduate students,
and in the context of a research laboratory, this book would be an excellent resource as a reference guide for
scientists at all levels.” V.Emuss, Institute of Cancer Research, London.

Also, from the first edition:

“Pelengaris, Khan, and the contributing authors are to be applauded. The Molecular Biology of Cancer is a
comprehensive and readable presentation of the many faces of cancer from molecular mechanisms to clinical
therapies and diagnostics. This book will be welcomed by neophyte students, established scientists in other
fields, and curious physicians.” -Dean Felsher, Stanford University
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From reader reviews:

Christina Love:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person?
If you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They have to answer that
question simply because just their can do that. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person.
Yes, it is right. Because start from on guardería until university need this The Molecular Biology of Cancer:
A Bridge from Bench to Bedside to read.

Dolores Stiger:

This The Molecular Biology of Cancer: A Bridge from Bench to Bedside usually are reliable for you who
want to be a successful person, why. The reason why of this The Molecular Biology of Cancer: A Bridge
from Bench to Bedside can be among the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just
simple looking at food but feed you with information that probably will shock your previous knowledge.
This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book
and printed people. Beside that this The Molecular Biology of Cancer: A Bridge from Bench to Bedside
forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical
thinking that we know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Patricia Gross:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your
no cost time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you
want to test look for book, may be the guide untitled The Molecular Biology of Cancer: A Bridge from
Bench to Bedside can be fine book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Buddy Beckstead:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specially book entitled The
Molecular Biology of Cancer: A Bridge from Bench to Bedside your head will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind
friends. Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become one application form conclusion and
explanation this maybe you never get just before. The The Molecular Biology of Cancer: A Bridge from
Bench to Bedside giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving you
useful info for your better life on this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern is your body and
mind will be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this



extraordinary investing spare time activity?
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