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An essential guide to understanding the dynamics of a startup's board of directors

Let's face it, as founders and entrepreneurs, you have a lot on your plate—getting to your minimum viable
product, developing customer interaction, hiring team members, and managing the accounts/books. Sooner
or later, you have a board of directors, three to five (or even seven) Type A personalities who seek your
attention and at times will tell you what to do. While you might be hesitant to form a board, establishing an
objective outside group is essential for startups, especially to keep you on track, call you out when you flail,
and in some cases, save you from yourself.

In Startup Boards, Brad Feld—a Boulder, Colorado-based entrepreneur turned-venture capitalist—shares his
experience in this area by talking about the importance of having the right board members on your team and
how to manage them well. Along the way, he shares valuable insights on various aspects of the board,
including how they can support you, help you understand your startup's milestones and get to them faster,
and hold you accountable.

Details the process of choosing board members, including interviewing many people, checking references,●

and remembering that there should be no fear in rejecting a wrong fit
Explores the importance of running great meetings, mixing social time with business time, and much more●

Recommends being a board member yourself at some other organization so you see the other side of the●

equation

Engaging and informative, Startup Boards is a practical guide to one of the most important pieces of the
startup puzzle.
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From reader reviews:

David Martin:

The reserve untitled Startup Boards: Getting the Most Out of Your Board of Directors is the e-book that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The
language that publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate.
You also could possibly get the e-book of Startup Boards: Getting the Most Out of Your Board of Directors
from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Betty Smith:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Startup Boards: Getting the Most Out of
Your Board of Directors guide written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who else read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas
and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt Startup Boards:
Getting the Most Out of Your Board of Directors as good book not only by the cover but also with the
content. This is one book that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing a different
sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to
listening to an additional sixth sense.

Armando Morris:

Beside this Startup Boards: Getting the Most Out of Your Board of Directors in your phone, it could possibly
give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you
may got here is fresh through the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow town.
It is good thing to have Startup Boards: Getting the Most Out of Your Board of Directors because this book
offers to you readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you seldom get what it's all about. Oh
come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot
be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the idea? Find this
book in addition to read it from at this point!

Cheryl Lopez:

As we know that book is important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This e-book Startup Boards: Getting the Most Out of Your Board of Directors was
filled in relation to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your science competence.
Some people has diverse feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you
can sense enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book which you
wanted.
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