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There are many different ways to say "I." This book examines the ways in which four contemporary women
writers (Hélène Cixous, Assia Djebar, Gisèle Halimi, and Julia Kristeva) have written their autobiographical
"I" as a plural concept. These women refuse the individual "I" of traditional autobiography by developing
narrative strategies that multiply the voices in their texts. They similarly cast doubt upon current
theorizations of the female self in autobiography by questioning the possibility of plural selfhood in narrative
and its seemingly cathartic effects. Each writer approaches autobiography as a site of catharsis for a specific
trauma and each tells her story through multiple narrative voices in order to find atonement. The women's
experiments with narrative voice are designed to render the female self accurately in narrative, but they
simultaneously expose the difficulties inherent in writing the self plurally.
Taken together, the women who form the corpus of this study move beyond critics' current understandings of
textual representations of selfhood. Informed by postcolonial and feminist approaches to selfhood, this book
charts the history of theories of autobiography and plots new ways of imagining this genre. This cross-
section of international writers calls for a new understanding of the inscription of female identity in
narrative; not as a binary of individual versus plural selfhood, but as a cluster of categories of identity
beyond "I" and "we."
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From reader reviews:

Ana Lopez:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot more
to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Studying a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Shifting Subjects: Plural Subjectivity in
Contemporary Francophone Women's Autobiography book because book offers you rich data and
knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may
already know.

James Mendoza:

The particular book Shifting Subjects: Plural Subjectivity in Contemporary Francophone Women's
Autobiography will bring you to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to explain the idea is
very unique. In the event you try to find new book to study, this book very suited to you. The book Shifting
Subjects: Plural Subjectivity in Contemporary Francophone Women's Autobiography is much recommended
to you to study. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Lynn Jordan:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic in the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different
to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book can be option to fill your totally free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want
to attempt look for book, may be the book untitled Shifting Subjects: Plural Subjectivity in Contemporary
Francophone Women's Autobiography can be excellent book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Tammie Jackson:

Shifting Subjects: Plural Subjectivity in Contemporary Francophone Women's Autobiography can be one of
your beginner books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away because this guide has good
vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless
delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing
Shifting Subjects: Plural Subjectivity in Contemporary Francophone Women's Autobiography however
doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource data that maybe
you can be one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.
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